City of Carlsbad, NM

Aquatic Park Site Improvements

Bid Opening Evaluation
12/5/2017; 11:00 am

Bidder Bid Lot #1 - Deck Bid Lot #2 - Fence Bid Lot.#3 ) Bid Lot #4 Combo
Electrical
Wade Construction S 57,700.00 $8,500 $23,000 89,200.00
Carreon Construction S 88,500.00 $8,500.00 $21,421.00 118,421.00
Abraham's Construction S 121,000.00 $12,000.00 $44,000.00 174,000.00
Greer Construction S 126,665.00 $6,892.00 $20,193.00 178,664.00
MHATT Inc. S 79,000.00 no bid no bid no bid
Guadalupe Mountain Fence Co. no bid $7,662.00 no bid no bid
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